
Our mission statement is as follows: 

We exist to proclaim Jesus as Lord and Savior, based on the teaching of God’s Word, in the midst of
providing a quality camp experience.  

Since we only have students a week at a time we strive to avoid issues that can be divisive and focus on
Jesus Christ as Savior and the hope of the world.  We have a basic doctrinal statement that is as follows:

1. The Word of God 

We believe that the Bible is the Word of God, fully inspired and infallible, written under the inspiration of
the Holy Spirit, and that it has supreme authority and is trustworthy in all matters of faith and conduct. 

2. The Trinity 

We believe that there is one living and true God, eternally existing in three persons, that they are equal in
every divine perfection, and that they execute distinct but harmonious offices in the work of creation,
providence and redemption.

a. God The Father 

We believe in God, the Father, an infinite, personal spirit, perfect in holiness, wisdom, power and love. We
believe that He concerns Himself mercifully in the affairs of men, that He hears and answers prayer, and
that He saves from sin and death all who come to Him through Jesus Christ. 

b. Jesus Christ 

We believe in Jesus Christ, God’s only begotten Son, conceived by the Holy Spirit. We believe in His
virgin birth, sinless life, miracles, and teachings. We believe in His Lordship, substitutionary atoning
death, bodily resurrection, ascension into heaven, perpetual intercession for His people as High Priest,
and His second coming. We believe that salvation is found in no other name, that Jesus Christ is the only
way to heaven. 

c. Holy Spirit 

We believe in the Holy Spirit who came forth from the Father and Son, to convict the world of sin,
righteousness, and judgment; to regenerate, sanctify, and empower all who believe in Jesus Christ. We
believe that the Holy Spirit indwells every believer in Christ, seals eternally, and that He is an abiding
helper, teacher, and guide. 

3. Salvation

We believe that all men by nature and by choice are sinners, but that “God so loved the world that he
gave his one and only Son, that whoever believes in him shall not perish but have eternal life.” We believe
therefore, that those who accept Christ as Lord and Savior will rejoice forever in God’s presence, and
those who refuse to accept Christ as Lord and Savior will be forever separated from God. 

The accepting of the Gospel (Good News) is clearly described by Paul in Romans 10:9-10 "If you declare
with your mouth, “Jesus is Lord,” and believe in your heart that God raised him from the dead, you will be
saved. 10 For it is with your heart that you believe and are justified, and it is with your mouth that you
profess your faith and are saved."  


